AN ACT
ENTITLED, An Act to create an intensive methamphetamine treatment program and revise the
General Appropriations Act for fiscal year 2007, and to declare an emergency.
BE IT ENACTED BY THE LEGISLATURE OF THE STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA:

Section 1. The Department of Corrections, the Department of Health, and the Department of
Human Services may create a program for the purpose of providing intensive methamphetamine
treatment for females in the state correctional system.

Section 2. That section 8 of chapter 26 of the 2006 Session Laws be amended to read as follows:
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Correctional Health

F.T.E., delete "71.0" and insert "72.0"
Adjust all totals accordingly.
Section 3. That section 16 of chapter 26 of the 2006 Session Laws be amended to read as
follows:
DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
Community Services
Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$1,557,291" and insert "$1,842,291"
Operating Expenses, Other Funds, delete "$1,441,478" and insert "$1,666,478"
F.T.E., delete "82.5" and insert "89.3"
Adjust all totals accordingly.

Section 4. That section 17 of chapter 26 of the 2006 Session Laws be amended to read as
follows:

DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN SERVICES

Alcohol & Drug Abuse

HB No. 1258 Page 1



Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$3,678" and insert "$177,095"
Operating Expenses, Other Funds, delete "$264,286" and insert "$577,915"
F.T.E., delete "49.0" and insert "54.0"
Adjust all totals accordingly.
Section 5. Whereas, this Act is necessary for the support of the state government and its existing
public institutions, an emergency is hereby declared to exist, and this Act shall be in full force and

effect from and after its passage and approval.

HB No. 1258 Page 2



An Act to create an intensive methamphetamine treatment program and revise the General
Appropriations Act for fiscal year 2007, and to declare an emergency.

I certify that the attached Act
originated in the

HOUSE as Bill No. 1258

Chief Clerk
Speaker of the House
Attest:
Chief Clerk
President of the Senate
Attest:

Secretary of the Senate

House Bill No. 1258
File No.
Chapter No.

Received at this Executive Office
this day of ,

20 at M.

for the Governor

The attached Act is hereby
approved this day of
,AD,20

Governor

STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA,
SS.
Office of the Secretary of State

Filed , 20
at o'clock M.
Secretary of State
By

Asst. Secretary of State



